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Abstract—This study aimed to develop and assess user 

acceptability of a clinical nursing mobile application tool 

(CNMAT) to enhance follow-up care for patients in Lusaka, 

Zambia. A mixed-methods sequential exploratory design was 

employed, involving three phases: exploration of nursing 

procedures for home-based case, CNMAT design and 

prototyping, and user acceptance assessment. This write-up 

focuses on phase one which involves the exploring suitable 

clinical nursing care procedures for the CNMAT and assessing 

the intention to use the CNMAT through in-depth interviews 

with 13 clinical nurses. Findings suggest that a wide range of 

nursing procedures can be safely conducted at home, but 

successful implementation requires addressing challenges such 

as limited resources, patient factors, and the need for training 

and support. The CNMAT offers potential benefits in improving 

follow-up care, but the research is still ongoing for the 

subsequent stages.  
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I. INTRODUCTION  

Quality access to healthcare services, mainly in follow-up 
care services for patients by clinical nurses, remains a 
challenge in resource-constrained settings like Lusaka, 
Zambia [1]. This is exacerbated by the increasing burden of 
chronic diseases, such as diabetes, hypertension, and 
cardiovascular diseases, which require ongoing management 
and follow-up [1] [2]. The lack of accessible and affordable 
healthcare services can also lead to poor patient outcomes, 
leading to increased morbidity, and mortality [3]. To address 
these challenges, innovative approaches are needed to 
improve the delivery of healthcare services [4]. Mobile health 

(mHealth) technologies have emerged as promising tools for 
enhancing access to healthcare, especially in underserved 
areas [4] [5]. By leveraging the power of smartphones and 
mobile health applications (mHealth) can facilitate 
communication between healthcare providers and patients, 
improve adherence to treatment regimens, and provide timely 
interventions [5][6][7][8]. This study seeks to close up this 
gap by developing and assessing user acceptability of a 
clinical nursing mobile application tool (CNMAT) for 
follow-up care at the University Teaching Hospitals (UTHs) 
in Lusaka, Zambia. 

II. METHODOLOGY 

A mixed-methods sequential exploratory design has been 
employed [9], this involves three phases: phase one, stage one 
involves information gathering using key informant 
interviews from various units at the UTHs, to identify suitable 
home-based nursing procedures and associated challenges for 
follow up care and their intention to use the application if 
implemented. For phase one stage two, a validation of the tool 
will be done were 200 patients and care givers will be 
interviewed using a structured interview schedule. They will 
also be assessed on the intention to use the application. Phase 
two will involve the CNMAT Design and Prototyping based 
on the findings from phase one, the CNMAT will be designed 
and prototyped to incorporate relevant features and address 
identified challenges. Lastly the user acceptance assessment 
will be conducted i.e. the CNMAT will be evaluated for user 
acceptability among clinical nurses, patients, and caregivers. 
However, this write up only encompasses results for phase 
one, stage one were a qualitative research design was 
employed, involving in-depth interviews with 13 clinical 
nurses working in various medical, surgical units and 
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specialty clinics at the University Teaching Hospitals (UTHs) 
in Lusaka, Zambia. Participants were asked about their 
experiences and perspectives regarding follow-up care 
services, the types of procedures they thought were suitable 
for follow-up care services in patients’ homes, challenges and 
opportunities associated with follow-up care, their views on 
mobile health applications in general and their intention to 
use the CNMAT. The interviews provided important insights 
into the possibility and potential benefits of follow-up care 
for surgical and chronic medical patients in Zambia. 

III. FINDINGS 

Key findings from the interviews included the feasibility of 
home-based procedures for follow up care. A wide range of 
clinical nursing procedures such as wound care, medication 
administration, vital signs monitoring and patient education 
etc. were identified as suitable procedures to be conducted in 
patients’ homes for follow-up care. Some challenges to 
follow-up care which participants highlighted were Limited 
human & material resources, including insufficient staff, 
inadequate infrastructure, and lack of equipment to use for 
follow-up care services. These were consistently highlighted 
as significant barriers. One of the key informants emphasized 
the impact of these challenges, stating, "There's no proper 
system, No, there's nothing like that, because most of the time 
you just see them (patients) again once they're re admitted, 
yes, that's when we get to see them. Otherwise, once they're 
discharged, that's where the relationship is broken” (RN 11).  
Other factors that were mentioned as barriers to effective 
follow-up were systemic issues such as lack of management 
support. Participants in this study recognized the potential of 
mobile health applications to improve access to follow-up 
care for patients with surgical and chronic medical conditions 
in Zambia, particularly for those living in remote areas. A 
participant expressed enthusiasm for the use of mobile 
applications, stating, "I think it's convenient, like we talked 
about transportation issues and other challenges that patients 
may face, so it can be of help, like a patient just being 
followed to their home, or maybe using the app just to get in 
touch with the patient is okay, yeah. (RN 8).” 

IV. DISUSSION  

The findings of the phase one, stage one of this study suggest 
that home-based nursing procedures can be a valuable 
approach for providing follow-up care services in Lusaka, 
Zambia [10]. However, addressing challenges such as limited 
human and material resources, patient factors, and the need 
for training and support is essential for successful 
implementation [11][12]. The CNMAT offers potential 
benefits in improving access to nursing follow-up care, 
facilitating communication between patients, caregivers and 
clinical nurses, and providing educational resources for 
patients and care givers[14][15]. However, the study is still 
on going and further research will be needed to assess its 
effectiveness and address identified challenges, such as 
internet connectivity and device limitations. Please note that 
the remaining phases of the study (CNMAT design and 

prototyping, and user acceptance assessment) would be 
conducted in subsequent stages and would provide additional 
insights into the feasibility and acceptability of the CNMAT. 

V. CONCLUSION 

Overall, the findings suggest that follow-up care using the 
CNMAT can be a valuable approach for providing clinical 
nursing services for chronic medical and surgical patients in 
Lusaka, Zambia. The CNMAT if it is to be implemented will 
also requires a comprehensive and well-supported 
implementation strategy. The CNMAT has the potential to 
significantly increase access to follow-up care in Zambia, for 
patients in remote and urban areas. By addressing the 
identified challenges and implementing a comprehensive 
approach, Clinical Nurses can enhance patient outcomes and 
lessen the strain on healthcare facilities. 
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